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Infertility is known as the pregnancy failure 
after a year of normal, constant, and without 
prevention intercourse (1). Infertility and its 
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nancy failure 
after a year of normal, constant, and without 
prevention intercourse (1). Infertility and its 

problems are not caused only because of
having a child, but other factors such as 
disorders in marital and familial relationships, 
feelings of rejection when others judge them, 
self-blame, and others’ disapproval have a large 
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Background & Aims of the Study: According to the high prevalence of mental 
problems of infertility in infertile women and the necessity of identifying their 
mental statuses to carry out interventions to help them, the present study aims a 
comparative study of psychological well-being, meta-emotion, and resiliency in 
fertile and infertile women. . 

Materials & Methods:  This study is a A case-control study was conducted on 
infertile women who referred to health centers of Gonabad, Iran. The subjects are 
80 infertile women and 80 fertile women selected via an available sampling 
method. Questionnaires of resiliency, psychological well-being, and meta
were employed, and the data were analyzed by SPSS software and
variance analysis test (MANOVA). 

 Significant differences were observed in terms of psychological well
being (p<0.01), positive meta-emotion (p<0.05), and resiliency (p<0.01).

Conclusions:  thus, infertile women showed lower level records than fertile 
Lower levels of psychological well-being, positive meta-

resiliency in infertile women confirms the importance of attending to infertile 
women’s mental health and emotional statuses even more. 
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problems are not caused only because of not 
having a child, but other factors such as 
disorders in marital and familial relationships, 
feelings of rejection when others judge them, 

blame, and others’ disapproval have a large 
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impact on psychological and personal aspects, 
familial and communicative functions, and 
eventually decrease the overall quality of life in 
couples, and in some cases they find their lives 
spoiled (2).  

Infertility, especially in women, is an extremely 
stressful phenomenon. Because of the severity 
of this stressor and its emotional pressures, 
confronting with it affects an individual's 
psychological resources, undermines the 
resiliency and mental well-being (3). 
Psychological well-being is the perception of 
positive engagement with challenges of life and 
striving for realizing the true potential abilities. 
Because of the repeated failures in conceiving 
children, infertile couples have a lower level of 
psychological well-being in comparison with 
normal subjects (4). Cooper has reported the 
prevalence of psychological well-
problems in infertile couples compared with a 
control group (5). Eisenberg, Fabes ,Guthrie & 
Reiser, comparing psychological well-being in 
normal individuals and infertile women, found 
that the infertile women showed lower levels of 
positive relationships with others, 
purposefulness, and self-acceptance.  

Furthermore, infertile women represent 
significantly lower scores in physical 
functioning, levity, social functioning, 
emotional functioning, and mental health (6). In 
a research on mental health, comparing the 
fertile and infertile women, Besharat found that 
sources of stress and damage in infertile women 
cause mental health indicators to be in a weaker 
position compared with fertile women (7). The 
results of some studies such as Andrews, 
Abbey, and Halman suggest that infertile 
couples experience less satisfaction with their 
lives compared to fertile couples (8). 
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sources of stress and damage in infertile women 
cause mental health indicators to be in a weaker 
position compared with fertile women (7). The 
results of some studies such as Andrews, 

d Halman suggest that infertile 
couples experience less satisfaction with their 

Resiliency is another variable which decreases 
due to infertility stress. Resiliency is the 
capacity to face, overcome, and be strengthen
by the experience of problems or damages (9). 
Issacson (10) states that resiliency is merely 
adjustment, and positive coping with problems 
and troubles. According to this view, resiliency 
is not only ability or a personal characteristic, 
but these abilities and characteristics in 
interaction with stressors determine whether a 
person has the ability to cope with stressors. 
Researches also suggest that infertility reduces 
the personal strength in facing with problems of 
life, and generally infertile people
hardiness and resiliency against difficulties than 
normal individuals (11, 12). 

Another variable which infertile individuals are 
faced with is meta-emotion. Emotions can 
influence a range of cognitive processes such as 
attention, memory, judgments, and decision
makings (13). Meta-emotion is beyond meta
cognition (14) and may create a malicious cycle 
and it reflects the effects. When a person is 
faced with a situation, good feeling and 
optimism alone are not enough to control his 
emotions. He needs to be in the best cognitive 
function at the moments as well in order to 
control his emotions (15). In general, meta
emotion enables us with greater flexibility to 
respond to various environmental events. Many 
studies have shown that ability of an individ
in cognitive emotion regulation plays an 
important role in his adaptation to stressful life 
events (6, 16). Yousefi in his study showed that 
non-adaptive and negative emotion regulation 
strategies such as self-blame and catastrophic 
consideration of an event are considered as the 
factors associated with the development of 
psychopathology (17). Therefore, infertility 
stress, due to its intensity, can affect the meta
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emotion of the individuals, and consequently 
may result in failure to cope with infertili
stress.  

Aims of the study: Considering infertile 
women’s psychological problems due to the 
stressors of infertility, the present study sought 
to investigate the difference between fertile and 
infertile women in terms of psychological well
being, meta-emotion, and resiliency.  

 

 
A case-control study was conducted on all 
infertile women who referred to health centers 
of Gonabad, Iran for following diagnosis and 
treatment. Subjects included 80 fertile females 
and 80 infertile women selected by an available 
sampling method. The samples were organized 
according to variables of age, marriage 
duration, and education. 

The subjects wereaged 20 to 40 years old with 
at least an associate's degree, and were married 
for 1 to 10 years. Also, the issue of infertility 
was attributed to the female who was conscious 
of it for at least a year, and in terms of health 
status, she should have been physically healthy 
and the infertility problems  were not caused by 
chronic diseases such as diabetes, kidney 
disease, cardiovascular disease, and 
psychological diseases. 

The meta-emotion questionnaire was created 
for meta-emotion variables. This questionnaire 
has 28 items and each item is subjected to a six
degree (a completely false to completely true) 
answer. Meta-emotion scale has six 
components: (1) sympathized attention, (2) 
meta-rage, (3), meta-interest, (4) meta
humiliation, shame, (5) meta-mind control, and 

Materials & Methods 
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emotion of the individuals, and consequently 
may result in failure to cope with infertility 

Considering infertile 
women’s psychological problems due to the 
stressors of infertility, the present study sought 
to investigate the difference between fertile and 
infertile women in terms of psychological well-

control study was conducted on all 
infertile women who referred to health centers 
of Gonabad, Iran for following diagnosis and 

Subjects included 80 fertile females 
and 80 infertile women selected by an available 
sampling method. The samples were organized 
according to variables of age, marriage 

The subjects wereaged 20 to 40 years old with 
ociate's degree, and were married 

for 1 to 10 years. Also, the issue of infertility 
was attributed to the female who was conscious 
of it for at least a year, and in terms of health 
status, she should have been physically healthy 

were not caused by 
chronic diseases such as diabetes, kidney 
disease, cardiovascular disease, and 

emotion questionnaire was created 
emotion variables. This questionnaire 

o a six-
degree (a completely false to completely true) 

emotion scale has six 
components: (1) sympathized attention, (2) 

interest, (4) meta-
mind control, and 

(6) meta-self-control. Cronbach's al
coefficient has been reported 70% to 80% (18). 
The correlation of this scale was reported 
meaningful with NEO Personality 
Questionnaire, Positive and Negative Emotions 
Scale, Beck Depression Scale, and Meta
Cognition scale (19). 

In order to determine the well-being of fertile 
and infertile women, Ryff Scales of 
Psychological Well-Being (RSPWB) (1989) 
was used. In this scale, answering to each 
question is determined on a six-degree range 
(from strongly disagree to strongly agree). 
Psychological well-being of each scale has 14 
questions involving self-
environmental dominance, positive relations 
with others, life purposefulness, personal 
growth, and independence. Ryff and Keyes has 
calculated the internal consistency of the 
questionnaire 0.91, using Cronbach's alpha 
coefficient (20). The six-factor Ryff Scale 
achieved 0.94 for the total scale, and was 0.63 
to 0.89 for subscales using the internal 
consistency (Cronbach's alpha) in 2004 by 
Zanjani (21). Scores in this method according 
to Likert scale were 1 to 5, and in some 
questions, the inverse grading procedure was 
used. 

To measure resiliency, Conner
Resilience Scale (CD-RTS9) (2003) was used. 
Conner-Davidson Resilience Scale has 25 items 
in which the items are scored based on a Likert 
scale from zero (completely false) to five 
(always true). The scale has been normalized in 
Iran by Mohammadi (22). To determine the 
scale validity, the correlation of each item with 
the total score of coefficients was calculated 
0.41 to 0.64. To assess the reliability of 
Conner-Davidson Resilience Scale (CD
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Iran by Mohammadi (22). To determine the 
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reliability values of Cronbach's alpha were used 
and coefficient of 0.89 was obtained. 

 

 
 Results showed that 36.2% of fertile women 
and 34.8% of infertile women were aged 
between 20 and 25, 35% of fertile women and 
42.5% of infertile women were aged 26 to 31, 
and 28.8% of fertile women and 23.8% of 
infertile women were aged 31 and above. 
46.2% of fertile women and 38.8% of infertile 
women were married for 1 to 3 years, 27.5% of 
fertile women and 47.4% of infertile women for 
3 to 6 years, and 26.3% of fertile women and 
13.8% of infertile women were married for 
more than 6 years. 

Before conducting the multivariate variance 
analysis, in order to verify the homogeneity 
assumption of variance-covariance, Box tes
was used, and the results were found to 
beinsignificant (P>0.85, Box’s Mean= 5.35). 
Covariance matrices of psychological well
being, meta-emotion, and resiliency variables 
for the varying levels of fertility were equal. 
Results of fertilization study, using Wilks 
Lambda test on linear combinations of 
psychological well-being, meta-emotion, and 
resiliency variables, showed significant effects 
of the variable (η2=0.73, P<0.01, F=4.34) on 
the psychological well-being, meta-emotion, 
and resiliency of the subjects. 

According to the statistical significance of 
Wilks Lambda test, in order to determine the 
source of significance of multivariate effects, 
multi-variant analysis (MANOVA) was 
performed for each of the psychological well
being, meta-emotion, and resiliency variables, 
separately. According to the single-variant 

Results 
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ency variables, 
variant 

variance analysis to assess reproductive effects 
(Table 2), there are statistical significant 
differences between fertile and infertile women 
in terms of resiliency (P<0.01, F (1) = 5.88), 
meta-emotion (P<0.05, F (1) = 2.65), and 
psychological well-being (P<0.01, F (1) = 
8.35). Looking at the averages of these 
variables (Table 1), fertile women scored 
higher levels on the variables of resiliency, 
meta-emotion, and psychological well
compared with infertile women. 

Table 1: Mean and standard deviation of
psychological well-being, meta-emotion, and 

resiliency variables 

 

Table 2: Multi-variant of variance analysis 
(MANOVA) to assess reproductive effects on 

psychological well-being, meta-emotion, and resiliency

 

 
The study aimed to compare the variables of 
psychological well-being, meta-emotion and 
resiliency in fertile and infertile women. The 
results showed that there were significant 

Meta-
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l well-Being Groups 

SD M SD M 

11.9 
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of  
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545.5 
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variance analysis to assess reproductive effects 
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emotion, and psychological well-being, 

Table 1: Mean and standard deviation of 
emotion, and 

variant of variance analysis 
(MANOVA) to assess reproductive effects on 
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differences between fertile and infertile women 
with respect to all three variables. Infertile 
women compared to infertile women had lower 
scores in psychological well-being, meta
emotion, and resiliency. Lower levels of 
psychological well-being, meta-emotion, and 
resiliency of infertile women compared to 
fertile women are consistent with the studies of 
(4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 12, 11, 16) that reported lower 
levels of psychological well-being, meta
emotion, and resiliency in infertile women. 
Generally, this research suggests that infertile 
women have more problems in terms of 
psychological well-being, in the scales of 
positive relationship with others, 
purposefulness, self-acceptance, physical 
functioning, levity, social functioning, and 
emotional functioning. They also have lower 
mental health levels andlower mental health 
indicators. Moreover, they experience less 
satisfaction with life and show more anxiety 
and depressive symptoms. Infertility and its 
problems are not caused only because an 
individual does not have a child, but also 
because disorders in marital and familial 
relationships, feelings of rejection by others, 
and self-blame and others’ disapproval greatly 
affect individuals’ psychological and personal 
aspects, and familial and communicative 
functions, and altogether, decrease the quality 
of life in couples. Female infertility undermines 
the personal and social values i.e. the sense and 
value of being a mother and a wife, and it 
makes the meaning and purpose of marriage as 
meaningless for the individuals. Because of the 
severity of this stressor and its emotional 
pressures, confronting with it imposes on the 
individual's psychological resources, 
undermines the resiliency, and reduces the 
mental well-being (12). 
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makes the meaning and purpose of marriage as 

Because of the 
severity of this stressor and its emotional 
pressures, confronting with it imposes on the 
individual's psychological resources, 
undermines the resiliency, and reduces the 

Resiliency occurs when a person adjusts herse
with her circumstances. To describe this mode, 
psycho-social bio-balance term is used. Psycho
social bio-balance is a period in which a person 
physically, mentally, and socially adjusts to a 
set of circumstances, good or bad. Psycho
social bio-balance is typically threatened by 
urgency, stressors, adverse conditions, 
opportunities, and other forms of internal and 
external changes. These threats externally or 
internally can be due to the severity or due to 
the thoughts and feelings, respectively (23). 

Stimulators can be the new bits of information, 
experiences or repetitive thoughts and feelings. 
To cope with the emergency of life, using the 
past experiences, individuals extend the quality 
of resiliency so that more incidents have 
become common events, and less likely to be 
destructive. Chronic or severe stressors when 
they occur to people, according to their 
intensity and duration, undermine their coping 
resources and resiliency, and make them 
vulnerable to mental health problems. In 
addition to the severity of the stressor in an 
individual, her thoughts and feelings are 
effective in her ability to cope with encountered 
stressors. The threats cause primary emotions 
such as anger, hurt, loss, guilt, fear, confusion, 
and disorientation, and these emotions, i
can lead to setting up the secondary emotions. 
In this case, given that these are negative 
emotions, they cause a vicious cycle and 
enhance the intensity of the negative emotion.

  

According to lower levels of psychological 
well-being, positive meta-emotion, and 
resiliency recognized in infertile women than 
fertile women, the necessity of attending to 

Conclusion 

 

---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
2014 

Publisher: Research Center for Environmental Pollutants, Qom University of Medical Sciences. All rights reserved. 

133-139

137 

Resiliency occurs when a person adjusts herself 
with her circumstances. To describe this mode, 

balance term is used. Psycho-
balance is a period in which a person 

physically, mentally, and socially adjusts to a 
set of circumstances, good or bad. Psycho-

s typically threatened by 
urgency, stressors, adverse conditions, 
opportunities, and other forms of internal and 
external changes. These threats externally or 
internally can be due to the severity or due to 
the thoughts and feelings, respectively (23).  

imulators can be the new bits of information, 
experiences or repetitive thoughts and feelings. 
To cope with the emergency of life, using the 
past experiences, individuals extend the quality 
of resiliency so that more incidents have 

d less likely to be 
destructive. Chronic or severe stressors when 
they occur to people, according to their 
intensity and duration, undermine their coping 
resources and resiliency, and make them 
vulnerable to mental health problems. In 

ity of the stressor in an 
individual, her thoughts and feelings are 
effective in her ability to cope with encountered 
stressors. The threats cause primary emotions 
such as anger, hurt, loss, guilt, fear, confusion, 
and disorientation, and these emotions, in turn, 
can lead to setting up the secondary emotions. 
In this case, given that these are negative 
emotions, they cause a vicious cycle and 
enhance the intensity of the negative emotion. 

According to lower levels of psychological 
emotion, and 

resiliency recognized in infertile women than 
fertile women, the necessity of attending to 
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infertile women’s mental health status and their 
emotions is perceived rather more. Intervention 
measures to be carried out for this group of 
people are teaching resiliency skills, cognitive, 
and meta-cognitive interventions to improve 
their evaluation of the stressfull event, and 
accept their emotional reactions towards
themselves. 

The effects of other stressors on infertile 
women, such as spouse support and family 
income (due to the high treatment costs) have 
not been assumed in this course of 
investigation. Thus, further studies are 
recommended to assess the effects of 
stressors. 
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